Reference: FOI 39458 BUCKS 14Y
Subject:

Paediatric Continence

I can confirm that the CCG does hold some of the information requested; please see responses below:

QUESTION

RESPONSE

1. Please state whether the following five paediatric continence (bladder and bowel) services are commissioned by your CCG / funded by your
Health Board:
a. Bedwetting (Yes/No)

If yes, for ages __ to __

Yes 0-19

b. Daytime wetting (Yes/No)

If yes, for ages __ to __

Yes 0-19

c. Toilet training (Yes/No)

If yes, for ages __ to __

Yes 0-19

d. Constipation/soiling (Yes/No)

If yes, for ages __ to __

Yes 0-19

e. Product (nappy/pad/washable pants) supply for paediatric
continence problems (Yes/No) If yes, for ages __ to __

Yes 0-19

If any of the above services are not commissioned/funded and
delivered by your CCG/Health Board, does anyone else provide any
of these services? (Yes/No)

Yes

If yes, please provide details of which partner organisation provides
them, which service(s)they provide and the age ranges:

Buckinghamshire Healthcare NHS Trust (BHT)
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2 a. Is there a single (integrated) service for all the above five
problems? (Yes/No)

No

b. If the answer to 2a is yes, is this service led by a paediatric
continence advisor? (Yes/No)

Not Applicable

c. If the answer to 2a is no, please list the services that are
commissioned/provided and the designation of each of the
service leads:

Buckinghamshire Healthcare NHS Trust (BHT)

3. If the answer to 2a is yes, please could you tell us:
a. How many children and young people are on the waiting list for
this service?

Not Applicable

b. How long has the child currently at the top of the list had to
wait?
Buckinghamshire CCG does not hold this information.
4. If you answered yes to any part of question 1, please tell us how
many children and young people with continence problems are
currently on the caseload of the service?

May we suggest you contact our provider via the following link as they
may be able to provide the data required.
Buckinghamshire Healthcare NHS Trust (BHT)

5. Do you have any future plans to:
a. Commission/provide new paediatric continence service?
(Yes/No)

No

b. Review the existing paediatric continence service? (Yes/No)
If so, please provide details

This is currently being discussed
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6. a. How many full time equivalent staff specialising in paediatric
continence are currently employed by the services
commissioned by your CCG/provided by your Health Board?
Buckinghamshire CCG does not hold this information.
Please specify whether they:
May we suggest you contact our provider via the following link as they
may be able to provide the data required.

b. Are registered children’s nurse?
(No/Yes, some of them/Yes all of them)

Buckinghamshire Healthcare NHS Trust (BHT)

c. Have had specific training in paediatric continence management
(Yes/No)
7. a. Are you aware of the Children’s Continence Commissioning
Guide? (Yes/No)

Yes

b. If yes, do the services commissioned in/provided by your CCG
or Health Board use it? (Yes/No)

It is used to support potential reviews and specification updates

The information provided in this response is accurate as of 17 August 2021 and has been authorised for release by Robert Majilton, Deputy Chief
Officer and Director of Sustainability & Transformation for NHS Buckinghamshire CCG.
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