

**Reference:** FOI 39098 BUCKS 14Y

**Subject:** Cost of Chronic Pain

*I can confirm that the CCG does not hold the information requested; please see responses below:*

QUESTION	RESPONSE
1. How many consultations are there per year for chronic pain?	<p>Buckinghamshire CCG does not hold this information.</p> <p>May we suggest you contact our providers via the following links as they may be able to provide the data required.</p> <p><a href="#">Buckinghamshire Healthcare NHS Trust</a> (BHT)</p> <p><a href="#">Oxford University Hospitals NHS Foundation Trust</a> (OUH)</p>
2. How many patients per year does that represent?	
3. What is the total cost of care per year for Chronic Pain?	
4. What is the total Chronic Pain medication cost per year?	
5. Do you have a secondary care pain unit in the CCG? If so, how many referrals are made to this unit every year?	
6. Do you have community pain services? If so, what are the number of consultations made in these services per year? and what is the cost of care within these services per year?	

*The information provided in this response is accurate as of 18 June 2021 and has been authorised for release by Robert Majilton, Deputy Chief Officer and Director of Sustainability & Transformation for NHS Buckinghamshire CCG.*