

Reference: FOI 31296 BUCKS 14Y

Subject: Diagnostic Pathways for Adults

I can confirm that the CCG does hold some of the information requested; please see responses below:

QUESTION	RESPONSE
Part 1 - Please can you inform me whether NHS Buckinghamshire CCG commissions services that provide a diagnostic pathway for adults for the below named conditions	
a) Attention Deficit Hyperactivity Disorder (ADHD)	Yes; delivered by Oxford Health Foundation Trust
b) Dyscalculia	No specific pathway for adults – Published advice can found by following the link .
c) Dyslexia	
d) Dyspraxia (sometimes referred to as Developmental Co-ordination Disorder)	
Part 2 - If diagnostic pathways are not funded for any of the above named conditions, I would be grateful if you could inform me what NHS Buckinghamshire CCG's standard advice is to General Practitioners who wish to make a referral for adult diagnostic/assessment services for each such condition.	No Standard communication has been circulated

<p>Part 3 - If relevant figures are readily held, please can you inform me (i) how many referrals for adult diagnostic/assessment services for each of the above named conditions* have been funded by NHS Buckinghamshire CCG in the last three years, and</p>		
<p>ii. how many diagnoses have been made for each named condition over the last three years **</p>	<p>ADHD</p>	<p>This information is not held by the CCG; we suggest you contact our provider, Oxford Health Foundation Trust, as they may be able to provide the information required.</p>
<p>iii. What the gender breakdown of both the responses to (i) and (ii) were.</p>	<p>ASCs</p>	
	<p>Dyscalculia</p>	<p>This information is not held by the CCG.</p>
	<p>Dyslexia</p>	
<p>Dyspraxia</p>		

The information provided in this response is accurate as of 6 June 2019, and has been authorised for release by Robert Majilton, Deputy Chief Officer and Director of Sustainability & Transformation for NHS Buckinghamshire CCG.