

Reference: FOI 30745 BUCKS 14Y

Subject: Primary Care Networks (PCN)

I can confirm that the CCG does not hold some the information requested; please see responses below:

QUESTION	RESPONSE
<p>Any Primary Care Networks (PCN) within the CCG. Please include the following information: Please provide the information in the form of a spreadsheet/CSV file (or an alternative suitable format).</p>	
<p>1) Name of the PCN</p>	<p>The CCG does not hold this information.</p> <p>Our member practices are working together to form Primary Care Networks which will build on the core of current primary care services and enable greater provision of proactive, personalised, and coordinated and more integrated health and social care. Potential Primary Care Networks have been asked to submit registrations to the CCG for approval by 15 May 2019. As commissioners the CCG is required to ensure that 100% of the CCG's population is covered by a Primary Care Network and that the configuration of networks makes sense geographically to its constituent members, other community-based providers and the community. The Primary Care Commissioning Committee will review all applications and will look to approve all applications to NHS England by 31 May 2019 in preparation for a start date of 1 July 2019.</p>

2) List of Practices/organisations that fall within the PCN	Please see above response
3) Names of any of the leadership team that run the PCN	
4) Website/contact information for each PCN	

The information provided in this response is accurate as of 25 April 2019, and has been authorised for release by Robert Majilton, Deputy Chief Officer and Director of Sustainability & Transformation for NHS Buckinghamshire CCG.